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Life Quotes from Lutherans For Life 
Congregational Bulletin Blurbs for January–December 2022 
 

Share the For Life message all year long with Life Quotes !   
 

• Life Quotes are quotations on life issues—many from LFL resources and publications—for 
use in weekly congregational bulletins. You are also free to use the quotations in your 
monthly newsletter.   

• The quotes are dated but could generally be used any time.   
• We ask that Life Quotes be printed as written, in their entirety. 
• Life Quotes are available—free of charge—at lutheransforlife.org. 

 
Unless otherwise indicated, all Scripture quotations are from The Holy Bible, English Standard Version®, copyright © 2001 by Crossway Bibles, a publishing ministry of Good News Publishers. Used by permission. 
All rights reserved.  
 

Note: Thank you for using Life Quotes in your weekly bulletin. You may also wish to regularly use the following 
text to offer hope and help to those hurting from an abortion decision.  
 

Please consider including the following in your bulletins/newsletters:  

“Hurting from abortion? Word of Hope can help. word-of-hope.org; 888.217.8679.”  

 
January 2 “Friend of Jesus, no matter what painful or wonderful endings you marked in the past year, please watch for 
the early signs of new beginnings. Seize them as opportunities for you and God to develop together. Think about what the 
Bible teaches about life, appreciate God’s love for you, gather up bits and pieces of experience, and put them in a file 
named ‘lessons learned.’ Then keep it handy.” Jason Nelson, Time of Grace – A Life Quote from Lutherans For Life • 
lutheransforlife.org 
 
January 9 “[E]very human life, no matter the size, level of development, environment, or degree of dependency, is 
indispensable in fulfilling God’s plans.” Lynette Auch, president of Lutherans For Life – A Life Quote from Lutherans For 
Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
January 16 “You are not and never have been simply a number, a blob of tissue, or an invisible nobody. Rather, you are 
now and always have been God’s handcrafted gift to the world.” Michelle Bauman, director of Y4Life – A Life Quote from 
Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
January 23 “The Lord called all things into being, from the greatest to the least, with His mighty mere Word. But He 
formed the human bodies with His own fingers and His very breath. He lovingly, intimately, and meticulously knits us 
together in our mothers’ wombs.” Pastor Michael Salemink, Lutherans For Life – A Life Quote from Lutherans For Life • 
lutheransforlife.org 
 
January 30 “Because of Christ’s life, death, and resurrection, our Father now holds His hand out to each and every 
human being: perfect inclusion, perfection belonging—no exceptions! You are chosen! You are a branch who has 
received the Life of the Vine!” Marie MacPherson, author – A Life Quote from Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
February 6 “Say, ‘Congratulations and thanks be to God!’ Pregnancy is never a sin, and motherhood, even amid 
afflictions, is always a blessing. Our Lord has honored her with this holy vocation. She and her baby belong to Him from 
this time forth and forevermore!” Pastor Michael Salemink, Lutherans For Life – A Life Quote from Lutherans For Life • 
lutheransforlife.org 
 
February 13 “The Church can become a place of belonging for everyone. As much as a person feels invisible in their 
loneliness, the church has a place for them. Your Church can be a place where each person finds they are indispensable to 
the body of Christ.” Mona Fuerstenau – A Life Quote from Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
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February 20 “Jesus Christ has made every human life indispensable.” Pastor Michael Salemink, Lutherans For Life – A 
Life Quote from Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
February 27 “There’s so much work to be done, so many lives to protect. The unborn, the mentally ill, the hungry, the 
broken, and many others still need to hear about our hope in Christ and the love He has for us, and it’s our duty to bring it 
to them.” Katie Reid, 2021 Y4Life intern – A Life Quote from Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
March 6 “Just as God personally created your body, so too He continually designs His body, the Church, bringing 
together people from all walks of life, all nations, and all abilities, in service to the world. And while it may be true that 
the world does not appreciate the gifts you have to offer, the body of Christ most certainly needs you.” Michelle Bauman, 
director of Y4Life – A Life Quote from Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
March 13 “Paul kept his eyes on Christ who came and faced all the same heartaches, burdens, and sadness we do, and 
came through victorious. He shouldered our guilt and punishment on the cross and died that we might have life to the 
full.” Daily Devotion, Redeemer Lutheran Church, Sister Lakes, Michigan – A Life Quote from Lutherans For Life • 
lutheransforlife.org 
 
March 20 “The Word became flesh and God made Himself man as an embryo. Jesus took the lowliest form of a servant 
to leave no human life out.” Pastor Michael Salemink, Lutherans For Life – A Life Quote from Lutherans For Life • 
lutheransforlife.org 
 
March 27 “I cannot ponder every day the full life of Christ in the Gospels. But I can during the year on various days 
celebrate and ponder His Annunciation, Nativity, Presentation, Baptism, Temptation, Transfiguration, Triumphal Entry, 
Last Supper, Agony in the Garden, Arrest, Trial, Passion, Carrying of the Cross, Crucifixion, Death, Burial, Resurrection, 
Great Commission, or Ascension.” James M. Kushiner, executive director, Fellowship of St. James – A Life Quote from 
Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
April 3 “You and I are God’s workmanship as well. In and of ourselves we have nothing to offer God. But He gave us 
His Son, eternal life, forgiveness of sins, as well as the grace to serve Him. By God’s tender-mercies we are qualified to 
serve Him now and forevermore!” Daily Devotion, Redeemer Lutheran Church, Sister Lakes, Michigan – A Life Quote 
from Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
April 10 “The temptation among Christians is to take the temperature of the chaotic and dysfunctional culture and to 
imbue ourselves with a sense of despair and discouragement. But despair and discouragement, we know from Scripture, is 
a sin because it negates the hope of Jesus Christ. We are not seeking an earthly victory; as Christians, we know that the 
most important victory of all of history has already been won by our Lord and Savior.” Timothy S. Goeglein, vice 
president of government and external relations at Focus on the Family in Washington, D.C. – A Life Quote from 
Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
April 15 – Good Friday “The unconditional, sacrificial love of Jesus makes this day good. When your sins condemn you, 
He intercedes for you. When Satan seeks to devour you, Jesus defends you. When you are feeling spiritually empty, 
totally unworthy of God’s love, remember what Jesus has done to save you. He will never leave you or forsake you. He 
has ascended into heaven to prepare a place for you. If all of this sounds too good to be true, if you are looking for proof 
of this amazing love, then all you need to do is look to the cross. Look to Jesus. Look at your living Savior’s nail-pierced 
hands.” Rev. Peter Sulzle, St. John Evangelical Lutheran Church, Redwood Falls, Minnesota – A Life Quote from 
Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
April 17 “So how’s life? Are you stuck? Are you burdened? Are you troubled? Are you afraid? Do you think you’ve got 
nothing to live for? Stop acting like Jesus is dead because He’s not. Look again at His life-giving hands. Jesus is alive! 
Let’s act like it. Let’s pray like it. Let’s believe like it. Let’s embrace His call, ‘I am sending you’ (John 20:21), and bring 
the Gospel to everyone, one soul at a time. Live life like there is no death because Easter means there is no death. Easter 
makes life really worth living.” Rev. Peter Sulzle, St. John Evangelical Lutheran Church, Redwood Falls, Minnesota – A 
Life Quote from Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org  
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April 24 “Just as He did on the embryonic leg of your journey, the Lord is guiding you still. Just as He did when you 
cascaded down the fallopian tube, the Lord carries you still. You were created to listen to the words of the Lord. Listen to 
the One who knows you, who knows your entire journey.” Rev. Gary Blobaum, St. Paul Evangelical Lutheran Church, 
Oregon, Illinois – A Life Quote from Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
May 1 “Let’s also recruit, instruct, and support more couples and families toward opening their homes to serve children in 
need. Multitudes—majorities, even—of foster families and adoptive parents confess Christ and consider themselves for-
life. More foster parents—not fewer children—seems the most praiseworthy solution to foster care failures. And those 
who can recognize those failures may just be the most excellent candidates for the vocation!” Pastor Michael Salemink, 
Lutherans For Life – A Life Quote from Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
May 8 “Remember, it is your INDISPENSABLE hands that gather up all the coins from baby bottles, the diapers from 
diaper drives, and the layettes and baby clothes that keep pregnancy resource center shelves stocked and able to provide 
much needed support for a pregnant mother and father to choose life!” Jeff Duncan, Lutherans For Life – A Life Quote 
from Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
May 15 “Christians are called to proclaim the truth, and that truth is clear: All life is valuable. Each member of the human 
race is vital. All lives are indispensable because of Christ.” Michelle Bauman, director of Y4Life – A Life Quote from 
Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
May 22 “Your ascended Jesus goes with you. When you have doubts and struggles, take them to Jesus. When you’re 
conflicted and troubled by sin and guilt, take it to Jesus and the cross. Together we lift each other up and grow up in 
Jesus! You are gifted! You are equipped! Know you are serving Jesus! Now and to eternity.” Rev. Darren Green, St. John 
Evangelical Lutheran Church, Redwood Falls, Minnesota – A Life Quote from Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
May 29 “Every child is created by God, in His image, on purpose—for His purpose! This is the wonderful thing about 
human babies: ALL of us share this exact same thing in common—each of us is planned!” Barbara A. Geistfeld, D.V.M. 
Lutherans For Life regional director of Texas – A Life Quote from Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
June 5 “The Lord God loves your neighbors—even the ones that annoy you. He cares so much for them that He sent His 
Son to die and rise again for them—for all of them. For the thief, the bigot, the liberal, the conservative, the one with the 
manicured lawn who judges your overgrown lawn, and the one who has let their property become overgrown and run 
down. He cares for all of them. He cares so much that He called you and He placed you in that neighborhood to seek its 
welfare.” Rev. Dr. Jason Broge, guest speaker on The Lutheran Hour – A Life Quote from Lutherans For Life • 
lutheransforlife.org 
 
June 12 “God is love. God is relationship. His eternal love supplies the source of every life. He created humankind in this 
image, for Himself, for relationship, to be loved and to love.” Pastor Michael Salemink, Lutherans For Life – A Life 
Quote from Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
June 19 “The God who chose to give us life at the moment of fertilization is the same God who chose to rescue us and 
redeem us and give us salvation. And He did it by sending His Son, Jesus, to experience every stage of human life so we 
could be forgiven and given life everlasting with Him!” Rev. Craig Michaelson, Faith Community Lutheran Church, Las 
Vegas, Nevada – A Life Quote from Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
June 26 “God loves you as His adopted son or daughter—a truth that no virus or civil strife can ever take away. Welcome 
to the family!” Rev. Dr. Anthony (Tony) Cook, guest speaker on The Lutheran Hour – A Life Quote from Lutherans For 
Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
July 3 “Neither America, nor democracy, nor capitalism, nor socialism, nor military might, nor diplomacy can even come 
close to beginning to solve the problems that exist in this world. Even in America, without Christ, we are without hope. 
And really, what a wonderful message of joy that is. It is not man that will change the world, but Christ alone, for in the 
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end, the world cannot be changed; it is fully and completely at enmity with God.” Daily Devotion, Redeemer Lutheran 
Church, Sister Lakes, Michigan – A Life Quote from Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
July 10 “How sweet it is to have gathered around Jesus and learn again, or maybe learn for the first time, how He loves 
you and me. And He promises nothing is ever going to break this circle, ‘…neither death nor life, nor angels nor rulers, 
nor things present nor things to come, nor powers, nor height nor depth, nor anything else in all creation, will be able to 
separate us from the love of God in Christ Jesus our Lord’ (Romans 8:38b-39).” Rev. Dr. Dale A. Meyer, guest speaker on 
The Lutheran Hour – A Life Quote from Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
July 17 “Abortion advocates have no fear asserting what they imagine the Scriptures say or don’t say about the sanctity of 
life. Why shouldn’t our enthusiasm overshadow theirs? If Satan’s grown comfortable convoluting our truth, doesn’t the 
certainty and sensitivity our Savior has given welcome and even compel us eagerly to call out the devil’s lies?” Pastor 
Michael Salemink – A Life Quote from Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
July 24 “God has come down and given us His Son. But in times of doubt or struggle we can clearly see—through the 
eyes of faith—Christ the Savior, shining bright into our world. And so, we go down the mountain to the everyday and 
even the unknown. Like the disciples then, we go with Christ, the Lamb of God who takes away the sin of the world.” 
Rev. Cody Copper, guest speaker on The Lutheran Hour – A Life Quote from Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
July 31 “‘Therefore choose life,’ God said, ‘that you and your offspring may live.’ The way to choose life is to trust. 
Don’t panic. Did you think human life was going to be humanly possible? It’s not. It was never meant to be. Guiding a 
human being through the journey of life is possible only for God. That’s why the only way to choose life is to trust, to 
trust God. God gives no one a possible life. The call of God is to an impossible life. Otherwise, why trust? And life was 
created for trust.” Rev. Gary Blobaum, St. Paul Evangelical Lutheran Church, Oregon, Illinois – A Life Quote from 
Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
August 7 “God’s Son began His life weak and helpless, laid in a feeding trough. He began His ministry weak and 
tempted, vulnerable in the desert. In a weakened state from the scourging, Jesus died on the cross, making you right with 
God, filling you with His strength. And when God supplies your strength, you are strong, indeed.” Marie MacPherson, 
author – A Life Quote from Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
August 14 “Why bother living today as a child of God, striving to follow the Lord’s will in words and actions in spite of 
trials? Why bother showing love and forgiveness toward those who hurt you? Why share the news of a Savior when it 
seems to have little effect? Because we live in the light of Jesus’ love. Our sins are paid for and gone. Jesus’ victory is 
ours. He promises: ‘I am the light of the world. Whoever follows me will never walk in darkness, but will have the light 
of life’ (John 8:12). In His light every difficulty, no matter how intimidating in our eyes, fades away. Problems become 
opportunities for His glory to shine all the more!” Daily Devotion, Redeemer Lutheran Church, Sister Lakes, Michigan – 
A Life Quote from Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
August 21 “Fostering may result from brokenness, but it also provides opportunity for Gospel-motivated courage and 
compassion.” Pastor Michael Salemink, Lutherans For Life – A Life Quote from Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
August 28 “So, pray, dear army of God, for the courage to seize opportunities to speak of God’s saving glory and the 
peace it brings! So, pray, dear army of God, for those God has sent, in His name and ours, to herald that message where 
we cannot go! So, pray, dear army of God, that God would … equip the next generation of faithful witnesses to add their 
voices to the chorus.” Rev. Dr. Rich Gurgel, president of Martin Luther College – A Life Quote from Lutherans For Life • 
lutheransforlife.org 
 
September 4 “We all belong, first and foremost, to God. His creative and redemptive acts bring value and meaning to our 
lives. Because we belong to Him, He provides all we need. Our lives also belong to each other, and because we are 
connected through the body of Christ, we are not alone. We are necessary to each other as we serve through our 
vocations.” Michelle Bauman, director of Y4Life – A Life Quote from Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
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September 11 “A Christian funeral isn’t the end. Yes, we don’t deny death. That would be foolish and insensitive. But in 
Christ, we defy death. That’s Christian. Because the dead don’t stay down when Jesus is involved. They are saints 
triumphant! Encourage one another with these words.” Rev. Peter Sulzle, St. John Evangelical Lutheran Church, 
Redwood Falls, Minnesota Illinois – A Life Quote from Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
September 18 “To be authentic is to be vulnerable with others—and that may make us fearful. It might be messy, and that 
makes us uncomfortable. It takes time. Our reminder as we [the Church] seek to become a place of belonging is 1 
Corinthians 12:18: ‘But as it is, God arranged the members in the body, each one of them, as he chose.’” Mona 
Fuerstenau– A Life Quote from Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org   
 
September 25 “Every time we speak up for the sanctity of life, whether for the unborn, the disabled, the elderly, or the 
marginalized, we speak for hope. Every time we drop some coins or a check into a baby bottle, we stand for hope and 
healing and life. Every time we personally care for someone or hug someone or talk to someone who is in a crisis 
pregnancy or is disabled or is elderly or is marginalized, we show them Christ. We show them the common ground that 
transcends all our differences. We show them that all our lives matter because God made us. He chose each of us to be His 
child, and He will never leave us or forsake us. Let us never give up on baby bottle drives and hugs and smiles. The world 
needs us!” Barbara A. Geistfeld, D.V.M., Lutherans For Life regional director of Texas – A Life Quote from Lutherans 
For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
October 2 “It is easy to look at others in the world and label them as enemies, especially when they have different 
political, religious, or ethical beliefs than we do. But, when God looks at those individuals, He wants them to belong to 
His family, too. A fruit of faith can be to show other individuals, made in God’s image, that they, too, are chosen!” Marie 
K. MacPherson, author – A Life Quote from Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
October 9 “Moved by the Holy Spirit, may we help each other carry the crosses we face together. May we work to 
eliminate suffering together. And may we find healing, belonging, peace, and joy, together in the cross of Christ!” 
Michelle Bauman, director of Y4Life – A Life Quote from Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
October 16 “By God’s grace, and with His help, may we bear good fruit and make God-pleasing choices that glorify God 
who chose to create us and save us!” Rev. Craig Michaelson, Faith Community Lutheran Church, Las Vegas, Nevada – A 
Life Quote from Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
October 23 “We may think our prayers are small in relation to the magnitude of the problem of abortion. Not so! … 
Educate yourself, your children, and the people you know about Lutherans For Life … Support leaders who embrace 
these words, ‘All men are created equal, that they are endowed by their Creator with certain unalienable Rights, that 
among these are Life, Liberty, and the Pursuit of Happiness.’ … We have the most hopeful message the world has ever 
heard. You know it. God does big things with small stuff. How can we be so sure? Shiphrah and Puah, Jochebed, Miriam, 
and Moses … and especially Jesus.” Rev. Dr. Reed Lessing, Concordia University, St. Paul, Minnesota – A Life Quote 
from Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
October 30 “While we are on this side of eternity, the chance to serve and love our country and our neighbor and our 
community is as depthless as the Lord’s love for us. Engaging is a good, right, and humbling call.” Timothy S. Goeglein, 
vice president of government and external relations at Focus on the Family in Washington, D.C. – A Life Quote from 
Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
November 6 “Tune out the NOISE of the lies, bury yourself deep into God’s Word of truth, and go forth with the life-
affirming message, dressed in Christ’s priestly armor and standing as sentry in prayer!” Lynette Auch, president of 
Lutherans For Life – A Life Quote from Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
November 13 “Respect for God’s chain of authority holds true with the police, legislators, governors, presidents, and 
judges who have been placed over me. Some I may have chosen willingly, while others I may have voted against or had 
no say in. Still, we believe God has given them their authority. I may feel a responsibility to oppose their plans or how 
they perceive and execute justice, but even then, I owe them respect and honor.” Pastor Dan Guagenti, Holy Cross 
Lutheran Church, Shelbyville, Kentucky – A Life Quote from Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
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November 20 “In the Christian calendar, secular time is swallowed up in Sacred Time, which is a foreshadowing of the 
eternal Day of the Lord, when all that we have foolishly sought after and worried about will vanish as will the night 
vanish on the dawning of the Lord’s Day. Rejoice, the Lord is near.” James M. Kushiner, executive director, Fellowship 
of St. James – A Life Quote from Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
November 27 “These two choices are vastly different: to give birth to a child or to abort it. But one thing is the same: to 
choose Jesus is to choose life. For Jesus holds every life—even the tiniest—in the nail-scarred palm of His hand.” Rev. 
Gary Blobaum, St. Paul Evangelical Lutheran Church, Oregon, Illinois – A Life Quote from Lutherans For Life • 
lutheransforlife.org 
 
December 4 “Christmas is also a time to contemplate the gift of mortal LIFE through the miracle of birth. Christmas is 
the gift of LOVE that moms and dads shower on their children by saying yes to life—sometimes under very difficult 
circumstances. Regardless of the challenges, God has a perfect plan for each life that He brings into the world, and His 
will for them is to out-sparkle and out-shine any ornament.” Bradley Mattes, president of Life Issues Institute – A Life 
Quote from Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
December 11 “As sure as Christmas will come again on December 25, our Lord will come again. As we look forward to 
the Last Day, let’s dress for the occasion, putting on godliness and repentance. Let’s celebrate everything He did the first 
time He came to assure us of our home of righteousness. Let’s be spiritually awake and alert for His coming again, 
knowing that we will enjoy God’s perfect paradise, our eternal home.” Rev. Peter Sulzle, St. John Evangelical Lutheran 
Church, Redwood Falls, Minnesota – A Life Quote from Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
December 18 “Unlike Christmas ornaments, each baby is a unique life never to be replicated in all of history. Each life 
brutally snuffed out by abortion will leave the world a lesser place for it.” Bradley Mattes, president of Life Issues 
Institute – A Life Quote from Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 
 
December 25 “There is no more clear-pointed, rest-giving demonstration of the love of God for you than the gift of His 
Son.” Paul Tripp, pastor, author, and conference speaker – A Life Quote from Lutherans For Life • lutheransforlife.org 


